
FULLTIME EMPLOYMENT 
The City of Berlin Water and Sewer Utility is seeking qualified applicants for a full 
time General Utility Operator.  Requirements include a High School diploma, 
good driving record, hold a current CDL license or ability to obtain within 6 
months, ability to lift 85 pounds, ability to successfully complete water and 
wastewater basic exams as required for Certification within a year.  Mandatory 
random DOT drug testing is required for this position.  Applicants must be 
available to work nights, weekends, holidays and duty weeks as required every 4 
to 6 weeks.   Wage range for this position is $47,840 - $55,369 depending on 
experience and qualifications.  Excellent benefit package includes Wisconsin 
Retirement System, health insurance, paid sick leave, vacation, and holidays as 
well as on call pay. Application and job description may be obtained at Berlin City 
Hall, Water Dept office, 108 N. Capron Street or on-line at www.cityofberlin.net.  
Interested applicants should submit an application by 4:30 p.m. on May 27, 2022 
to:  Berlin Water & Sewer Dept, Attn:  Brian Malnory, PO Box 272, Berlin, WI 
54923-0272 or bmalnory@cityofberlin.wi.gov.  The City of Berlin is an equal 
opportunity employer.   
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SUMMER HELP 
The City of Berlin Water and Sewer Utility is seeking qualified applicants for 2 
part time summer help positions.  Requirements include a High School diploma, 
good driving record and ability to lift 85 pounds.  Hourly wage for this position 
starts at $12.00 per hour.  Applications may be obtained at Berlin City Hall, Water 
Dept office, 108 N. Capron Street or on-line at www.cityofberlin.net.  Interested 
applicants should submit an application by 4:30 p.m. on May 27, 2022 to:  Berlin 
Water & Sewer Dept, Attn:  Brian Malnory, PO Box 272, Berlin, WI 54923-0272 
or bmalnory@cityofberlin.wi.gov.  The City of Berlin is an equal opportunity 
employer.   
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